
OUR HISTORY

1991  Siam Land Flying Co., Ltd. is established as a private flight 
department to support the travel requirements of the groups own  
executives. 

1998  Siam Land Flying Co., Ltd. starts to offer private charter 
flights to the wider market under the brand name “Executive 
Wings”.  Executive Wings aims to serve the growing demands of 
the travelling passengers in the region and beyond with services 
which provide convenience, exclusivity, luxury and privacy. 

1999  Siam Land Flying Co., Ltd. continues to expand its services by 
adding Air Ambulance services under the brand name of “Medical 
Wings”.  Medical Wings offers ‘bed-to-bed’ transfers for all types 
of patients and age group experiencing severe medical conditions 
including pre and post natal and pediatric patients.  Medical Wings 
also provides patient escort services for transfers using 
commercial airline services to destinations.

2015 Medical Wings achieves the CAMTS standard from the US 
based Commission on Accreditation of Medical Transportation 
Systems and becomes the first Asian operator to achieve this 
prestigious recognition.  CAMTS recognizes the high quality of care 
and treatment that Medical Wings provides to both the patient 
and their companions.

2016 Medical Wings achieves the EURAMI standard of the 
European Aeromedical Institute. The attainment of the EURAMI 
accreditation is evidence of the consistent quality of service 
which Medical Wings clients rely upon their requirements in the 
Asian region and beyond.

CARE IN THE AIR
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OPERATING THOUGHOUT ASIA

Most of our cases involve critically ill patients requiring ICU 
conditions such as ischemic heart attack, emphysema, brain 
injuries, high risk pregnancy, acute myocardial infarction, stroke, 
multiple traumas and septicemia which may cause multiple organ 
failure.

We provide services ranging from ‘bed-to-bed’ air ambulance 
transfer for patients with the most urgent medical needs through 
to non-emergency ‘patient escort’ services within the region and 
beyond, operating 24 hours-a-day, 7 days per week.

Our medical staffs are certified in Aviation Medicine, Emergency 
Medicine, Critical Care Transport, Pediatric Critical Care Transport 
and these can be augmented by other medical specialists based 
on the medical condition, the nature of any injury or the age of the 
patient.

Our medical team evaluate and assess all patients prior to transfer 
to ensure that their condition is suitable for the flight and we are 
able to transport them safely to their destination. 

Medical Wings clients include many of the world’s largest 
insurance and assistance companies as well as private individuals, 
their families and companions.

We are the “ ICU in the Sky ”

WHAT WE DO



We are able to offer a ‘one stop service’ by owning or controlling 
all the major aspects of the patient transport process. Medical 
Wings own air ambulance fleet of Hawker 800/850XP’s and King 
Air 350’s are ideally suited to air ambulance missions.

Our medical flight crew is on hand throughout the patient 
transport procedure to ensure that the patient’s condition is 
continually monitored.  This enables real time decisions to be 
taken to manage any risks or complications and ensure that the 
patient arrives safely at their destination.

The vast experience of our medical coordinators enables them to 
manage and liaise with all parties involved in the patient transfer 
process, including the hospital staff, the patient’s family and any 
insurance or assistance company involved.

Our highly experienced flight operations team are able to 
undertake the most demanding missions safely and efficiently.  
Our operational knowledge and experience allows us to operate 
throughout the Asian region and beyond.

Medical Wings  operates four high performance aircraft in air 
ambulance configuration, including Hawker 800XP/ 850XP and 
Super King Air 350’s.  These fully pressurized aircraft provide 
patients with the optimum environment for medical transporta-
tion and are equipped with the state-of-the-art equipment.

Our air ambulances can accommodate 1-2 patients, medical flight 
crew and carry up to 2 companions on board so that they can 
accompany their family or loved ones.

Our aircraft are strategically based at Don Mueang International 
Airport in Bangkok, and from here we are able to provide optimal 
response times throughout Asia.   

Achieving the CAMTS and EURAMI standard demonstrates our 
commitment to safety and quality of service in the air ambulance 
sector. Our whole team, from the medical crew to the flight opera-
tions and maintenance teams work to deliver this on a daily basis.

Our highly experienced flight crew are trained by internationally 
recognized training organizations and are committed to safe 
operations in order to deliver the patients and their companions 
to their destination.

Our air ambulances are operated and maintained to international 
standards and carry insurance underwritten by some of the worlds 
largest insurers.

We offer a “ONE  STOP SERVICE”
Medical Wings team of highly trained doctors and nurses have 
state-of-the-art medical equipment to enable them to provide the 
highest levels of medical care throughout the  patient transfer 
process.
 
Our medical flight crews help determine which service is best 
suited for the patients needs and medical condition, whether that 
is a dedicated air ambulance service, a commercial stretcher or 
medical escort.

Each air ambulance mission is supported by a minimum of a  
two-person medical flight crew that consists of a critical care 
trained flight doctor and flight nurse who attend the patient 
throughout the transportation process.  Additional crew are 
assigned based on the patient’s condition.

Our repeat clients, such as the hospital groups and  international 
insurance and assistance companies, depend upon Medical Wings 
quality of care and reliability of service to support their patients 
and transfer them safely to their destination.

We provide “EXCELLENT CARE”

We own our “AIR AMBULANCE FLEET” We are committed to “SAFETY”

WHY US



222 Don Mueang International Airport Office Building 3rd  Floor, 
Vibhavadi Rangsit Road, Sanambin, Don Mueang, 

Bangkok 10210  Thailand

Hotline: +66 2247 3392 · Fax: +66 2535 4734
E-mail: m.w@medicalwings.com                      

www.medicalwings.com

Asia’s Leading Air Ambulance Provider
Operated by Siam Land Flying Co., Ltd.


